
Campus Wide Earthquake Drill 
Thursday, October 18, 2018 @ 10:18 a.m. 

Itinerary 
 
 
10:18  Simulate Earthquake – police units campus wide  
 

IP Phone Emergency Broadcast 1– Chief Trevis, Incident 
Commander 

 
“Attention, this is an El Camino College Emergency Broadcast 
from the Incident Commander at the Emergency Operations 
Center. This is a drill, this is a drill. 

 
We are experiencing a major earthquake – Drop, Cover and 
Hold On. Take cover under a sturdy object until the shaking 
stops.” 

 
10:20  IP Phone Emergency Broadcast 2 – Chief Trevis 
 

“Attention, this is an El Camino College Emergency Broadcast 
from the Incident Commander at the Emergency Operations 
Center. This is a drill, this is a drill. 

 
Shelter in Place and stay where you are until you receive 
notification from El Camino College Emergency Response 
Personnel or until you hear an evacuation alarm.” 

 
 
10:23:15 EOC Communication (Art Leible) to Building Captains via radio 
 

“This is Art Leible, Logistics Chief at the EOC. All Building 
Captains contact your floor leaders and prepare to evacuate 
your buildings when the fire alarms are activated. Should you 
experience an actual emergency during this drill, state clearly 
by way of your radio that ‘this is not a drill, we have a real 
emergency’. Direct building occupants to your assemble area. 
Monitor this channel for further instructions”.   

 
10:23:30 Activate Fire Alarm for Evacuation (Michael Clifford) 
 
10:30:00 Disengage Fire Alarm (Michael Clifford) 
 



10:35 EOC Communication (Art Leible) to Building Captains 
 

 “All Building Captains this is Art Leible at the EOC. We are 
going to begin a roll call of all buildings at this time. Please 
stand by and listen for your Building to be call.” 

 
10:45 EOC Communication (Art Leible) to Building Captains 
 

“All Building Captains. This Art Leible at the EOC. The 
Incident Commander has declared an All Clear. Return 
occupants to the buildings.” 

 
  End of Exercise 
 
 
 
 


